


Change Order Request 
 

PO # B200403  Request Date: 02/14/2020  College/Dept: EDC 

 

Vendor Name: Wards 

 

 ADD Line 2 for $500.00 with description FL.VA.PROJ: BLANKET PURCHASE ORDER 

FOR BIOLOGY SUPPLIES AS REQUESTED BY EL DORADO CENTER 

 

Budget to be charged GENFD 4500 11 FL.VA.PROJ 19000 00000 2020 101E 

 

 





1-1 1 LOT     1,000.00       1,000.00 07/10/2019BLANKET PURCHASE ORDER FOR BIOLOGY 
SUPPLIES AS REQUESTED BY EL DORADO
CENTER VALID 7/1/19 TO 5/31/20

      1,000.00   Sub-total 
          0.00   Est. tax 

 Total Requisition Amount:       1,000.00

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE:
KIM ZWERENZ
DAVID LAGALA
GREGORY MCCORMAC

NOTE TO PURCHASING:
ASSIGN B11___PO#
NO TAX
AMOUNT ONLY

FY19 B11

BU Acct Fd Org Prog Sub Proj Amount
GENFD 4300 12 ED.VI.BIOL 04000 00000 700P          1,000.00

Purchases Charged to Catagorical Programs, Grants or Special Project.

This purchase is in compliance with the requirement of ______________________________

For grants/special projects ______________________________________________________ 

__________________________________________________________________________ 

Name: ______________________________________________________ 

Requisition

Supplier: WARDS NATURAL SCI ESTAB INC 0000005885
PO BOX 92912
ROCHESTER NY 14692
United States

Phone: (800) 962-2660 Fax: (877) 247-0176
email:

Ship To: RECEIVING
6699 CAMPUS DRIVE
PLACERVILLE CA 95667

Business Unit: GENFD OPEN
Req ID: Date Page
0001020650 07/03/2019 1
Requisition Name:
2020 WARDS
Requester
Kimberly Zwerenz
Requester Signature

Buyer: Brenda Haney
Approved:  
Entered By: ZWERENZK 03-JUL-2019

Line-Schd Description Quantity UOM Price Extended Amt Due Date

Approval Signature Approval Signature Approval Signature



From: Zwerenz, Kim
To: Machani, Rachana
Subject: Re: Wards Natural _BPO#B200403
Date: Tuesday, June 16, 2020 3:03:18 PM
Attachments: image001.png

Yes, I had already asked that it be closed awhile ago.

Thanks

Kim

Sent from my Sprint Samsung Galaxy S10+.

From: Machani, Rachana <MachanR@flc.losrios.edu>
Sent: Tuesday, June 16, 2020 3:01:01 PM
To: Zwerenz, Kim <ZwerenK@flc.losrios.edu>
Cc: McCormac, Gregory <McCormG@flc.losrios.edu>; Taylor, Jennifer <TaylorJ@flc.losrios.edu>
Subject: Wards Natural _BPO#B200403
 
Good afternoon,
Can we go ahead and close this BPO?
It has a current balance of $ 270.18 (Line 1 GENFD 4300 12 ED.VI.BIOL 04000 00000 2020 700P).
Please see below for reference.

 
Thankyou,
Best regards,
Rachana.

mailto:ZwerenK@flc.losrios.edu
mailto:MachanR@flc.losrios.edu

PO Transaction History: B200403

POID

LINE]

VENDOR

[OPEN ENC]

EXPENDED TOTAL]

B200403]

[WARDS NATURAL SCI ESTAB INC]

27018

729.82

5200403

WARDS NATURAL SCI ESTAB INC]

0

500
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