
Paid Ch# 94-793051
3/16/20 Amt $ 4229.00



1-1 1 EA      4,229.00       4,229.00MEMBERSHIP 
NABITA 3 YEAR MEMBERSHIP - TEAM
PREMIUM 3 YEAR

      4,229.00   Sub-total 
          0.00   Est. tax 

 Total Requisition Amount:       4,229.00

PLEASE SET UP AS TWO WAY MATCH AND PAY INVOICE

BU Acct Fd Org Prog Sub Proj Amount
GENFD 5300 12 FL.VS.HLTH 64400 00000 425A          4,229.00

Purchases Charged to Catagorical Programs, Grants or Special Project.

Program Name:  Health
Project Grant:  425A
Program Director:  Sonia Ortiz-Mercado
Program Goal:  MENTAL HEALTH IN CRISIS SUPPORT

Requisition

Supplier: NABITA 0000036389
475 ALLENDALE RD STE 200
KING OF PRUSSIA PA 19406
United States

Phone: (484) 321-3651 Fax: (610) 993-0228
email:

Ship To: RECEIVING
10 COLLEGE PARKWAY
FOLSOM CA 95630

Business Unit: GENFD OPEN
Req ID: Date Page
0001024971 02/24/2020 1
Requisition Name:
NABITA 3 YEAR MEMBERSHIP
Requester
Olga Moskalyuk
Requester Signature

Buyer: Brenda Haney
Approved:  
Entered By: MOSKALYO 24-FEB-2020

Line-Schd Description Quantity UOM Price Extended Amt Due Date

Approval Signature Approval Signature Approval Signature





From: Ortiz-Mercado, Sonia
To: Moskalyuk, Olga
Subject: RE: NABITA 3 YEAR MEMBERSHIP Order 10492 was processed successfully.
Date: Friday, February 7, 2020 5:31:06 PM

Oh, we can charge the mental health grant for this…
 

From: Ortiz-Mercado, Sonia 
Sent: Friday, February 7, 2020 5:30 PM
To: Moskalyuk, Olga <MoskalO@flc.losrios.edu>
Subject: FW:NABITA 3 YEAR MEMBERSHIP Order 10492 was processed successfully.
 
HI Olga,
 
Can you generate a PO to pay for this membership for NaBITA? It’s a team membership for 3 years…
the invoice is below…
 
-Sonia
 

From: NaBITA <accounts@nabita.org> 
Sent: Friday, February 7, 2020 5:15 PM
To: Ortiz-Mercado, Sonia <Ortiz-S@flc.losrios.edu>
Subject: Order 10492 was processed successfully.
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of Los Rios. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

 

Thank you for your order, Folsom Lake College!

Want to view manage your order online? 
If you need to check the status of your order, please visit our home page and login to your account:

https://customer32114d705.portal.membersuite.com

Billing Information
Email Address:  
Billing Address:
10 College Pkwy 
Folsom, CA 95630-6798 US

 
Shipping Address:
10 College Pkwy 
Folsom, CA 95630-6798 US

 
Order Summary
Order #: 10492
Shipping Method:
Grand Total: $4,229.00
Amount Paid: $0.00
Balance Due: $4,229.00
 

Qty Product Unit Price Total

mailto:Ortiz-S@flc.losrios.edu
mailto:MoskalO@flc.losrios.edu
mailto:accounts@nabita.org
mailto:Ortiz-S@flc.losrios.edu
https://linkprotect.cudasvc.com/url?a=http%3a%2f%2femaillinks.membersuite.com%2fls%2fclick%3fupn%3dFpPG4F8V3mhXhCHFo8VirQaplguRN8vertLeHK0k8ub3ia2y-2BHiYI68oTMyiPVpgx0IE8t-2BYRNEiCHv6lV9HCA-3D-3Dz_hY_1wghNyHhUVCTaqXMbFwVB0DqUA-2B9Sjq9PiixlJp79-2BRIk7JT3qn9V6YtmsspjEHm9S-2F8B-2FP6L5LDT4TATzCmUMgjRexRhLyWa2oLy03m2ym-2Bp7GDlB-2BBpU-2B1-2Fx-2FKNQ9D6JN1pXZO12un1DLpqr2gMIA-2FeQyeAC-2B-2Fb4a757V3EKNUZBUeqC1jfcpcBjNpo9GDiTIgG14v9FMHqj2mvVSAEhfqnItK-2BLVVoybtwfXS24I-3D&c=E,1,TjH_HwChKx8RmspveQZ2Khqi9a6ZlwrH6hm0rDjvls45Ano-g38BGVMyi0IyGVHrP8hKPig81__lxxrMEa_wBjLGC14spUWySc6stz5Pl2Y9zngpdUmk_BwLGRd1&typo=1


1 NaBITA - Team Premium 3 Year $4,229.00 $4,229.00
Subtotal: $4,229.00
Shipping: $0.00
Taxes: $0.00
Discounts: $0.00
Grand Total: $4,229.00
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