








1-1 1 EA      5,000.00       5,000.00700P BLANKET PURCHASE ORDER FOR PAPER
AND SUPPLIES FOR PRINTING SERVICES
FOR FOLSOM LAKE COLLEGE

2-1 1 EA      5,000.00       5,000.00041A BLANKET PURCHASE ORDER FOR PAPER
AND SUPPLIES FOR PRINTING SERVICES
FOR FOLSOM LAKE COLLEGE

     10,000.00   Sub-total 
          0.00   Est. tax 

 Total Requisition Amount:      10,000.00

AUTHORIZED PERSONNEL:
KATHY BARNES LIGUORI
MELISSA WILLIAMS
TALINA BURKE

PY BPO B119058

7/1/2019 - 6/30/2020

NOTE TO PURCHASING:
ASSIGN B120___PO#
NO TAX
AMOUNT ONLY

BU Acct Fd Org Prog Sub Proj Amount
GENFD 4300 12 FL.VA.PRNT 49000 00000 700P          5,000.00
GENFD 4500 11 FL.VA.PRNT 67900 00000 041A          5,000.00

Purchases Charged to Catagorical Programs, Grants or Special Project.

This purchase is in compliance with the requirement of ______________________________

For grants/special projects ______________________________________________________ 

__________________________________________________________________________ 

Name: ______________________________________________________ 

Requisition

Supplier: KELLY PAPER 0000002966
1099 VINE ST
SACRAMENTO CA 95811
United States

Phone: (916) 616-9404
email: Kevin.Austin@spicers.com

Ship To: RECEIVING
10 COLLEGE PARKWAY
FOLSOM CA 95630

Business Unit: GENFD OPEN
Req ID: Date Page
0001019380 07/01/2019 1
Requisition Name:
2020 Kelly BPO
Requester
Kathy Barnes-Liguori
Requester Signature

Buyer: Brenda Haney
Approved:  
Entered By: BARNES-K 06-MAY-2019

Line-Schd Description Quantity UOM Price Extended Amt Due Date

Approval Signature Approval Signature Approval Signature



From: Barnes-Liguori, Kathy
To: Machani, Rachana
Cc: Williams, Melissa
Subject: Re: Kelly paper BPO# B200027
Date: Tuesday, June 23, 2020 11:50:00 AM
Attachments: image001.png

Yes. It is OK to close this PO.

From: Machani, Rachana <MachanR@flc.losrios.edu>
Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2020 11:46 AM
To: Barnes-Liguori, Kathy <BarnesK@flc.losrios.edu>
Cc: Williams, Melissa <WilliaM@flc.losrios.edu>
Subject: Kelly paper BPO# B200027
 
Good morning,
Can we go ahead and close this BPO?
It has a current balance of $209.27 (Line 1 GENFD 4300 12 FL.VA.PRNT 49000 00000 2020 700P) and
$6754.62(Line 2 GENFD 4500 11 FL.VA.PRNT 67900 00000 2020 041A). Please see below for
reference.

Thank You,
Best regards,
Rachana.

mailto:BarnesK@flc.losrios.edu
mailto:MachanR@flc.losrios.edu
mailto:WilliaM@flc.losrios.edu

PO Transaction History: B200027

POID |[LINE| VENDOR | OPEN ENC|[EXPENDED TOTAL]
B200027] 1 | KELLY PAPER] 20927 4790.73
B200027] 2 | KELLY PAPER]| 675462 7245.33
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