




1-1 1 EA        500.00         500.0008700 - BLANKET PO FOR HOME DEPOT
CREDIT CARD USE FOR ATHLETIC SUPPLIES
FROM 7/1/2019 TO 05/31/2020

2-1 1 EA        500.00         500.0008500 BLANKET PO FOR HOME DEPOT
CREDIT CARD USE FOR PE/KHA SUPPLIES
FROM 07/01/2019 TO 05/31/2020

      1,000.00   Sub-total 
          0.00   Est. tax 

 Total Requisition Amount:       1,000.00

NOTE TO PURCHASING: ASSIGN BLANKET PO#; NO TAX; AMOUNT ONLY; (PRIOR YEAR PO B119409)
DO NOT SEND TO VENDOR

AUTHORIZED PERSONNEL
LINES 1 & 2: JEFF CHALE, WILLIAM GARCIA, JEANNE CROFF, MATT WRIGHT

BU Acct Fd Org Prog Sub Proj Amount
GENFD 4300 12 FL.VI.KINE 08500 00000 700P            500.00
GENFD 4300 12 FL.VI.KINE 08700 00000 700P            500.00

Purchases Charged to Catagorical Programs, Grants or Special Project.

This purchase is in compliance with the requirement of ______________________________

For grants/special projects ______________________________________________________ 

__________________________________________________________________________ 

Name: ______________________________________________________ 

Requisition

Supplier: HOME DEPOT 0000002554
HOME DEPOT CRC/GECF
P O BOX 4536 DEPT. 24
CAROL STREAM IL 60197-4536
United States

Phone: (800) 685-6691 Fax: (800) 266-7308
email:

Ship To: RECEIVING
10 COLLEGE PARKWAY
FOLSOM CA 95630

Business Unit: GENFD OPEN
Req ID: Date Page
0001020558 07/01/2019 1
Requisition Name:
HOME DEPOT
Requester
Jeanne Croff
Requester Signature

Buyer: Brenda Haney
Approved:  
Entered By: M.J 01-JUL-2019

Line-Schd Description Quantity UOM Price Extended Amt Due Date

Approval Signature Approval Signature Approval Signature



From: Wright, Matt
To: Croff, Jeanne; Machani, Rachana
Cc: Chale, Jeffrey; Taylor, Jennifer
Subject: Re: Home Depot BPO B200359
Date: Tuesday, June 23, 2020 2:26:12 PM
Attachments: image001.png

Close please.  Thanks.

​

This is not the end I was hoping for.....but it is the one I expected.  Lucian Connally

From: Croff, Jeanne <CroffJ@flc.losrios.edu>
Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2020 12:48 PM
To: Machani, Rachana <MachanR@flc.losrios.edu>; Wright, Matt <WrightM@flc.losrios.edu>
Cc: Chale, Jeffrey <ChaleJ@flc.losrios.edu>; Taylor, Jennifer <TaylorJ@flc.losrios.edu>
Subject: RE: Home Depot BPO B200359
 
As far as I’m concerned, we should close it.
Matt, your call.
 
Jeanne Croff
Folsom Lake College, Administrative Assistant-Kinesiology/Health/Athletics/Nutrition
10 College Parkway, Folsom, CA (916) 608-6687
 
From: Machani, Rachana <MachanR@flc.losrios.edu> 
Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2020 12:45 PM
To: Croff, Jeanne <CroffJ@flc.losrios.edu>; Wright, Matt <WrightM@flc.losrios.edu>
Cc: Chale, Jeffrey <ChaleJ@flc.losrios.edu>; Taylor, Jennifer <TaylorJ@flc.losrios.edu>
Subject: FW: Home Depot BPO B200359
 
 
Good afternoon
Can we go ahead and close this BPO?
It has a current balance of $0.00(Line1 GENFD 4300 12 FL.VI.KINE 08500 00000 2020 700P), $0.04
(Line 2 GENFD 4300 12 FL.VI.KINE 08500 00000 2020 700P), $228.2(Line 3 GENFD 4300 12
FL.VI.KINE 08500 00000 2020 700P) and $102.37(Line 4 GENFD 4300 12 FL.VI.KINE 08700 00000
2020 700P) . Please see below for reference-
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PO Transaction History: b200359

B200359 1 |HOME DEPOT| 0] 14468
B200359 2 |HOME DEPOT| 0.04 398.83
B200359] 3 |HOME DEPOT)| 2282 0

B200359] 4 | HOME DEPOT]| 102.37 825.83
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