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1-1 1 EA      2,000.00       2,000.00 07/01/2019BLANKET PURCHASE ORDER FOR REPAIR OF
MEDIA SERVICES EQUIPMENT FOR FOLSOM
LAKE COLLEGE

      2,000.00   Sub-total 
          0.00   Est. tax 

 Total Requisition Amount:       2,000.00

VALID FROM 7/1/2019 - 6/30/2020
AUTHORIZED PERSONNEL:
DAVID HINDI
MICHELLE COYKENDALL
SARAH HILL
JEFF LEWIS

BU Acct Fd Org Prog Sub Proj Amount
GENFD 5600 11 FL.VA.AVSV 61900 00000 101E          2,000.00

Requisition

Supplier: EXTRON ELECTRONICS 0000017650
1025 E BALL ROAD STE 100
ANAHEIM CA 92805
United States

Phone: (714) 491-1500 Fax: (714) 491-1517
email: chubbert@extron.com

Ship To: RECEIVING
10 COLLEGE PARKWAY
FOLSOM CA 95630

Business Unit: GENFD OPEN
Req ID: Date Page
0001020069 07/01/2019 1
Requisition Name:
2020 EXTRON BPO REPAIR
Requester
Michelle Coykendall
Requester Signature

Buyer: Brenda Haney
Approved:  
Entered By: COYKENDM 12-JUN-2019

Line-Schd Description Quantity UOM Price Extended Amt Due Date

Approval Signature Approval Signature Approval Signature



From: Taylor, Jennifer
To: Harman, Joany
Cc: Machani, Rachana
Subject: Close: Extron Electronics B200279
Date: Wednesday, June 24, 2020 1:37:13 PM
Attachments: image001.png

CO EXTRON B200279 6-24-20.doc

Please process attached change order.
 

From: Coykendall, Michelle <CoykenM@flc.losrios.edu> 
Sent: Wednesday, June 24, 2020 1:32 PM
To: Taylor, Jennifer <TaylorJ@flc.losrios.edu>
Cc: Hindi, David <HindiD@flc.losrios.edu>; Hill, Sarah <hills@flc.losrios.edu>; Lewis, Jeff
<lewisj@flc.losrios.edu>
Subject: Re: Close: Extron Electronics B200279
 
Hi Jen,
 
We have no outstanding Extron repairs so this BPO is ok to close.
 
Thanks,
Michelle Coykendall 
Media Services 
 
 

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 19, 2020, at 1:10 PM, Taylor, Jennifer <TaylorJ@flc.losrios.edu> wrote:

﻿
Hello Michelle,
 
Can I go ahead and close this Blanket PO?
The current balance is $ 401.28.
Please let me know.
 
<image001.png>
 
Thanks,
 
Jen Taylor
FLC Account Clerk III
10 College Parkway
Folsom, CA 95630
916-608-6635

mailto:TaylorJ@flc.losrios.edu
mailto:harmanj@flc.losrios.edu
mailto:MachanR@flc.losrios.edu
mailto:TaylorJ@flc.losrios.edu

[PO Number [Requisition Number|[Requestor |[vendor |[Pre Encumbrances [Encumbrances|[YTD Payments|[PO Total [PO Balance |
[B200270 1020069 |[1020069 covkenDALLM HANEYB][EXTRON ELECTRONICS][S0.00 Jls401.28 Jls1.598.72 Jls2.000.00]fs40128 |





Change Order Request


PO # B200279

Request Date: 6/24/20

College/Dept: MEDIA SERVICES

Vendor Name 
EXTRON ELECTRONICS

X
Close remaining balance on PO.


Requested By: Michelle Coykendall
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