





From: Haney. Brenda

To: Pimental, Christy

Cc: Chueh, Valerie; Gibson. Bernard

Subject: 2nd Request_ RE: FOR YOUR ACTION_ SUPPORT DOCUMENTS REQUIRED FOR: LPO F3202 REIMBURSEMENT
FOR CHRISTY PIMENTAL

Date: Wednesday, May 25, 2016 11:06:44 AM

2nd Request - Still awaiting requested items highlighted below -

Thank you,

Brenda Haney

Business Services

Folsom Lake College | 10 College Parkway | Folsom, CA 95630

@ 916.608.6635 | <1 haneyb@flc.losrios.edu

From: Pimental, Christy

Sent: Tuesday, April 26, 2016 3:20 PM

To: Haney, Brenda <haneyb@flc.losrios.edu>

Subject: RE: FOR YOUR ACTION_ SUPPORT DOCUMENTS REQUIRED FOR: LPO F3202
REIMBURSEMENT FOR CHRISTY PIMENTAL

Ok, sorry | thought | had attached them. I'll get them to you on Thursday.
Christy Pimental

From: Haney, Brenda

Sent: Tuesday, April 26, 2016 1:24 PM

To: Pimental, Christy <pimentc@flc.losrios.edu>

Cc: Gibson, Bernard <GibsonA@flc.losrios.edu>; Dixon, Melanie <DixonM@flc.losrios.edu>; Slav,

Lyudmila <SlavlL @losrios.edu>
Subject: FOR YOUR ACTION_ SUPPORT DOCUMENTS REQUIRED FOR: LPO F3202 REIMBURSEMENT

FOR CHRISTY PIMENTAL
Importance: High

Hi Christy —
LRCCD Accounting requires the following support documents — before attached
reimbursement can be processed for payment:

1) List of Attendees or Workshop Sign In Sheet(s)

2) Workshop Agenda or Event Flyer Notification

Please email PDF copies of these items to BSO - haneyb@flc.losrios.edu and Cc:

slavli@losrios.edu

Thank you,
Brenda Haney

Business Services
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Folsom Lake College | 10 College Parkway | Folsom, CA 95630
@ 916.608.6635 | <1 haneyb@flc.losrios.edu

From: Slav, Lyudmila

Sent: Tuesday, April 26, 2016 11:57 AM

To: Haney, Brenda <haneyb@flc.losrios.edu>

Cc: Harman, Joany <harmanj@flc.losrios.edu>

Subject: LPO F3202 REIMBURSEMENT FOR PIEMNTAL CHRISTY
Importance: High

Hi Brenda/Joany,

| received LPO F3202 to reimburse Christy, but to be able to reimburse her, | need list of people who
attended workshop and either agenda or flyer. Please forward all requested documents to me so |
can process the payment.

Thanks,

Lyudmila
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