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1-1 1 EA        954.00         954.00 07/01/20236009C-9-15; 9-15 USERS-ATHLETIC
TRAINER SYSTEM HOSTING PAID ANNUALLY

        954.00   Sub-total 
          0.00   Est. tax 

 Total Requisition Amount:         954.00

ATTN: MATT WRIGHT

PLEASE PAY INV# 80068

BU Acct Fd Org Prog Sub Proj Amount
GENFD 5603 11 FL.VI.KINE 08700 00000 041A            954.00

Requisition

Supplier: KEFFER DEVELOPMENT SERVICES LLC 0000034866
24 VILLAGE PARK DRIVE
GROVE CITY PA 16127
United States

Phone: (724) 458-5289
email: sales@kefferdevelopment.com

Ship To: RECEIVING
10 COLLEGE PARKWAY
FOLSOM CA 95630-6798

Business Unit: GENFD OPEN
Req ID: Date Page
0001043353 07/01/2023 1
Requisition Name:
FY 2024  KEFFER DEVELOPMENT
Requester
Matthew Wright
Requester Signature

Buyer: Brenda Haney
Approved:  
Entered By: M.J 01-MAY-2023

Line-Schd Description Quantity UOM Price Extended Amt Due Date

Approval Signature Approval Signature Approval Signature



Payments may be made by credit card/payment card via phone/email; or by check.

Invoices are subject to 1.5% interest per month if not paid within terms.  

Customers outside of the United States must "Self Assess" and pay any applicable taxes.

Questions? Please call 724-458-5289 or email sales@kefferdevelopment.com

Keffer Development Services LLC

24 Village Park Drive
Grove City, PA  16127 US
+1 8883282577
sales@kefferdevelopment.com
www.athletictrainersystem.com

INVOICE
BILL TO

Los Rios Community 
College District
4700 College Oak Drive
Sacramento, CA  95841

INVOICE # 80068
DATE 05/01/2023

DUE DATE 06/01/2023
TERMS Net 30

  

ACTIVITY QTY RATE AMOUNT

6009C - 9-15
9-15 Users - Athletic Trainer System 
Hosting Paid Annually

1 900.00 900.00T

 

SUBTOTAL 900.00
TAX 54.00
TOTAL 954.00
BALANCE DUE $954.00



Payment	services	brought	by:
Intuit	Payments	Inc.
2700	Coast	Avenue,	Mountain	View,	CA
94043
Phone	number	1-888-536-4801
NMLS	#1098819

For	more	information	about	Intuit
Payments’	money	transmission	licenses,
please	visit
https://www.intuit.com/legal/licenses/payment-
licenses/.

Payment	receipt

You	paid	$954.00
to	Keffer	Development	Services	LLC	on	7/13/2023

Invoice	no. 80068

Invoice	amount $954.00

Total $954.00
No	additional	transfer	fees	or	taxes	apply.

Status Paid

Payment	method Credit	Card

Authorization	ID MS0179785574

Thank	you

Keffer	Development	Services	LLC

+1	8883282577

www.athletictrainersystem.com	|	sales@kefferdevelopment.com
24	Village	Park	Drive,	Grove	City,	PA	16127

https://www.intuit.com/legal/licenses/payment-licenses/


From: Zabegalin, Tatyana
To: Chadwick, Sera
Subject: RE: US BANK BOR FOR 07/24/23 STATEMENT
Date: Wednesday, August 2, 2023 3:38:07 PM
Attachments: image001.png

Approved.
Please process.
 
Thank you!
Tatyana
 

Tatyana Zabegalin
Business Services Supervisor
Folsom Lake College | Los Rios Community College District
zabegat@flc.losrios.edu
P. (916) 608-6622
10 College Parkway, Folsom, CA 95630
LOSRIOS.EDU

 
 
 
 

From: Chadwick, Sera <ChadwiS@flc.losrios.edu> 
Sent: Wednesday, August 2, 2023 1:31 PM
To: Zabegalin, Tatyana <ZabegaT@flc.losrios.edu>
Subject: RE: US BANK BOR FOR 07/24/23 STATEMENT
 
Hi Tatyana,
 
Please review and approve attached BOR.
 
Thank you,
 
Sera Chadwick
Account Clerk III | Business Services Office
(916)608-6635
chadwis@flc.losrios.edu
Folsom Lake College
10 College Parkway
Folsom, CA 95630
 

From: Zabegalin, Tatyana <ZabegaT@flc.losrios.edu> 
Sent: Wednesday, August 2, 2023 12:32 PM
To: Chadwick, Sera <ChadwiS@flc.losrios.edu>
Subject: US BANK BOR FOR 07/24/23 STATEMENT
 
Hello Sera,

mailto:ZabegaT@flc.losrios.edu
mailto:ChadwiS@flc.losrios.edu
mailto:zabegat@flc.losrios.edu
https://losrios.edu/
mailto:chadwis@flc.losrios.edu
mailto:ZabegaT@flc.losrios.edu
mailto:ChadwiS@flc.losrios.edu
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Please submit BOR for US Bank payment for $954.00.
 
Please use invoice number as 4246 0445 5574 3768 and the date - 07/24/23.
 
Thank you!
Tatyana
 

Tatyana Zabegalin
Business Services Supervisor
Folsom Lake College | Los Rios Community College District
zabegat@flc.losrios.edu
P. (916) 608-6622
10 College Parkway, Folsom, CA 95630
LOSRIOS.EDU

 
 

mailto:zabegat@flc.losrios.edu
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